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The unexpected beneficiary to a trust fund created to honor a Vietnam war hero, Becca McGee struggles
with the changes sudden wealth will bring to her ordinary life and its influence on her twelve-year-old
daughter. Facing a challenge to her faith, she’s bombarded by questions she can’t answer. And, her common
sense seems to have vanished. The lawyer retained to settle the trust proves himself a jerk, acts like a stalker,
and appears to be an impostor. When someone prematurely leaks the details of the trust to the press, steals
her cat, and threatens her daughter... he’s her prime suspect. Still, she finds him incredibly attractive. J.T.
Harrison’s plans to practice family law are derailed when a large firm offers him a position in its probate
department. Fresh out of law school and studying for the bar, he can’t refuse the income. Now he’s a
political hire moonlighting for his rich uncle, well paid for doing menial tasks—delivering manila envelopes
and overseeing floral deliveries. But why is his elderly uncle secretly sending yellow roses to a woman half
his age who could easily steal J.T.’s heart? As the story unfolds, an old man’s obsession mixes romance with
a touch of suspense and mystery as it threatens every aspect of Becca McGee’s life. J.T. must settle the
Rogue Trust while his ailing uncle still lives. Becca has stolen J.T.’s heart, but she’s quick to condemn. And,
with his knack for falling victim to circumstantial evidence, it seems unlikely that J.T. can settle the trust or
win Becca’s hand.
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From reader reviews:

Kimberly Williams:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite guide and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your problem; you can
add your knowledge by the guide entitled The Rogue Trust. Try to face the book The Rogue Trust as your
pal. It means that it can to get your friend when you really feel alone and beside that of course make you
smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you more confidence because you
can know everything by the book. So , let me make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Joseph Bateman:

Reading a book being new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you examine a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, since book has
a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that you have
read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you act like
you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, as well as soon. The The
Rogue Trust will give you new experience in examining a book.

Rose Taylor:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like The Rogue Trust
which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Kenneth Connolly:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen want book to know the upgrade information of year for you to year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. With
the book The Rogue Trust we can acquire more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? To get
creative person must prefer to read a book. Merely choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't
always be doubt to change your life at this time book The Rogue Trust. You can more desirable than now.
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